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SUFFOLK COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE PRESENTS SIMULTANEITY ON THE 
AMMERMAN CAMPUS IN SELDEN THROUGH OCTOBER 6, 2013 

 
Selden, NY – The Maurice N. Flecker Gallery on the Ammerman Campus of Suffolk County 
Community College in Selden will host Simultaneity curated by Gabriel Phipps through October 
6, 2013. 
 
The artists in this exhibit collectively define simultaneity as a viewing experience rich in 
associations and visual phenomena – a pool of conflicting sources and viewpoints that only make 
sense together in a fictional world. Peculiar and often tense combinations include subjects seen 
from multiple perspectives; forms that function as windows; objects whose scale vacillates 
between human-size and the infinite; paint that describes pictorial space while asserting itself in 
literal space; forms that are at once synthetic and organic, solid and ephemeral, static and kinetic. 
 
The artists herein approach the pictorial notion of simultaneous experience by way of shared and 
individual roads. Each painter owes a certain debt to cubism and builds on that institution. 
Emphasizing paint’s materiality, Dannielle Tegeder creates illusionistic images that highlight 
artifice. Drawing on Pop and Modernist traditions, Steve McCall manipulates scale with forms 
that are both figurative and landscape-based. Through the use of intuitive and intellectual 
processes, Nick Lamia constructs what appear to be naturally occurring machines. Meghan 
Brady employs flat, volumetric forms to create images that are landscapes and pure abstraction. 
Gabriel Phipps makes solid, freestanding structures that verge on collapse, while referencing 
pink flesh, metal shards and glowing television screens with those same tenuous structures. 
 
Gallery hours are Monday through Thursday from 12:00 p.m. until 3:00 p.m..  For additional 
information, please call 631-451-4093. 

 
About Suffolk County Community College 
Suffolk County Community College (SCCC) is the largest community college in the State 
University of New York (SUNY) system, enrolling approximately 26,000 students at its three 
campuses in Selden, Brentwood and Riverhead. SCCC offers the Associate in Arts (A.A.), 
Associate in Science (A.S.), and Associate in Applied Science (A.A.S.) degrees, as well as a 
variety of certificate programs. Offering affordable college tuition, a highly respected Honors 
program, extensive extracurricular activities, championship athletic teams, and numerous transfer 
programs, SCCC is a first-choice college for Long Island students. Visit us online at 
sunysuffolk.edu. 
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